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Presents: 



Ceracoat™ is a company dedicated to the 
development of  Nano-Technology that both 
protects your world and makes your life easier.  
Dr. Keller and Mr. Harmsen came up with the idea 
of creating a ceramic coating for engines. 

 
In 1988 the product was born, and since it is a 
ceramic coating the Ceracoat™ name was legally 
registered. Today, Ceracoat™ has about 100 
applications for consumers and about 150 for 
industry with a total of about 250 different 
applications. 
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ABOUT US 



 
 

Since the inception of the company, Ceracoat™ 
has maintained a special laboratory for 
researching Nano-Technology and its 
capabilities for covering and protecting almost 
every surface. 

 
Elio's vision for Ceracoat™ is taking the 
Ceracoat™ Brand to new heights; aligning the 
beauty and significance of its products in tune 
with the needs of people who dream of living in 
sync with green technology. 
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Together with his wife, VP Carmen Keller and the 
Ceracoat™ R&D Department, our team is working 
on new exciting formulas that will revolutionize 
the way you live your life. Nano-Tech for your 
work and your life style. 
 
Ceracoat™ is 100% Swiss made, with an 
incredible Swiss Warranty, utilizing the latest 
technologies. 
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SOME TESTS AND CERTIFICATIONS 
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5,000,000 CHF 
Swiss Francs 

Insurance Policy 
For Any Ceracoat 

Product. 
This is the 

Equivlent of  
$5,250,000 In US 

Dollars! 
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PRODUCTS 
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THANK YOU FOR YOUR 
ATTENTION ! 


